
 

 

 

 
 

Fact Sheet: Parents Caring for Adult Children Need 
Access to Paid Leave 

No one should have to choose between caring for their loved ones and maintaining their economic security, 

but many parents of adult children are forced to make that impossible choice when their children need care. 

Many young adults, in particular, depend on their parents for care when they are sick or managing a 

disability. Parents need paid sick time and paid family and medical leave laws that use expansive and 

inclusive language to ensure that they can care for their children in times of need. 

Adult Children Increasingly Rely on Parental Care 

• Many young adults continue to rely on their parents for care. In 2022, 55.8 percent of men and 53.6 
percent of women between the ages of 18-24 lived in the same household as their parents.i 

• Young adults who are single are more likely to continue to live and rely on their parents into adulthood. ii 
The number of single adults has increased throughout the years, making it so that more adults are relying 
on their parents as their main support system. 

• Since the 2008 recession, there has been a steady increase in young adults relying on their parents for 
financial assistance.iii  

• Young adults are also increasingly facing mental health challenges.iv Often, due to a lack of available 
professional support, these adults need parental support to aid them in these challenges. Further, young 
adults often rely on their parents to assist them in seeking out professional support and receiving 
diagnostic evaluations.v 

 

Adult Children with Disabilities Rely on Parental Care 

• An estimated 3 million young adults, between the ages of 14-24 live with some type of disability.vi 

• Around 50 percent of children with disabilities continue to live with their parents into their adult life. Of 
the adult children with disabilities who live outside of the home, 44 percent of parents still devote 
significant time to assisting with daily tasks such as money management, transportation, and shopping.vii 
Oftentimes parental caregivers will not only assist with daily tasks, but also complex medical tasks. This 
can include things such as medication monitoring, infusion therapy, tube feeding, vital monitoring, etc.viii 

• Many parents of adults with disabilities have low rates of social participation, likely due to the fact that 
they have limited discretionary time and their caregiving responsibilities can impact their own health. 
Finding appropriate care for their children and managing the demands of caregiving alongside other 
responsibilities is exceedingly time-consuming. This leaves these parents with little support, impacting 
both their mental and physical health, resulting in higher levels of anxiety and physical pain affecting 
daily routines.ix  
 

Parents who Care for Adult Children Have Their Own Care Needs 

• Even among adult children who do not live with their parents, a significant number still rely on them for 
caregiving needs. Oftentimes parents must balance caring for their adult children with their work 
responsibilities. Balancing both roles can be challenging.x 



 

 

 

• Caring for adult children can also take a financial toll on parents. Forty-five percent of parents still 
provide financial support for at least one adult child. Among these parents, the average monthly expense 
to provide this support was $1,400.xi  

• Sixty-two percent of older adults do not receive any financial support to help care for a family member. 
Twenty-one percent are concerned with their ability to retire.xii  

• The challenges posed by caring for adult children, especially without needed support, are not only 
financial. Forty-eight percent of older caregivers reported feeling stressed or overwhelmed by their 
caregiving duties and twenty-six percent have stated that their own health has been negatively 
affected.xiii  

• Studies have shown that when a family member has serious health concerns, it affects the mental health 
and well-being of the immediate surrounding family members. Parents with older children, who have 
serious health conditions, reported a higher feeling of psychological distress than parents with younger 
children.xiv 

Importance on Paid Leave for Parental Caregivers 

• Paid leave laws are essential for individuals to take care of themselves and their loved ones without 
putting their economic security at risk.  

• These paid leave laws can help parents balance their jobs and provide care for their adult children. 
Additionally, paid leave laws allow parents to take care of themselves if any healthcare concerns arise 
from their caregiving responsibilities.  

• Paid leave laws need to be more inclusive, allowing parents to not only care for their adult children with 
disabilities, but also their adult children who rely on them for care and support.  
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